
Happy New Year! As it turned out, 2023 was a year of recovery in both stocks and bonds, though that 

seemed anything but a forgone conclusion back in October. Both equities and fixed income rallied in 

November and December as the Federal Reserve signaled its intent to not only halt the rate increases, 

but to cut rates in 2024. In December alone, the US aggregate bond market increased 3.8 percent which 

was almost 70% of its full year return of 5.5 percent. The DOW Jones, S&P 500, and NASDAQ increased 

4.9, 4.5 and 5.6 percent respectively for the month (Reuters). Currently markets have six 2024 rate cuts 

priced in; while we think that may prove to be too many, we also believe the first rate cut is likely to 

come as soon as March. 

Lisa Shalett, our Chief investment Officer, writes in this month’s On the Markets, that “Investors will 

likely remember 2023 as a great year… But for economists, strategist, and financial advisors, 2023 will be 

studied for years to come” as a year that completely defied history and expectations. “Many well-worn 

paradigms broke in 2023. Consider that it was the first time in decades that rapidly rising interest rates 

neither destroyed aggregate demand nor dented corporate profits. Thanks to roughly 15 years of balance 

sheet repair and negative real rates, the US economy was essentially rendered rate-insensitive.” 

2023 certainly defied our team’s expectations. Our January 2023 outlook proved to be far too gloomy as did 

Morgan Stanley’s and Wall Street’s in general, though we did correctly predict that bonds would rebound 

from their worst year in 50 years after the negative returns of 2022. Our team eventually turned more 

bullish, but it took until October when we began to expect a Fed signal on rate cuts was imminent based on 

improved inflation readings. 

What are our predictions for 2024? 

1) We think other investments outperform the Magnificent Seven. Last year’s big winners tend to be this 

year’s laggards. We continue to favor the “Wee 493” as they have been dubbed – which is just our way 

of saying, everything but the Magnificent 7 stocks that produced most of the gains in 2023. The 

strategist most closely aligned with our thinking on our first prediction is probably Richard Bernstein. He 

wrote an excellent year-ahead outlook back in December that highlights many of the data points we are 

also focused on and reaches many of the same conclusions. Chief among them: risk seems excessively 

concentrated in Mega-cap US Stocks where good earnings may nevertheless disappoint markets. On the 

other hand, like Bernstein we especially like US small cap stocks, US cyclical stocks, international and 

emerging market stocks. Bernstein also notes that industrials could also perform well if this period of 

deglobalization continues. Lisa Shalett also agrees, writing in her weekly commentary on January 8th that 

investors should “favor value over growth, and SMID and large cap over megacap.” 

2) Contrarianism and diversification pay dividends in 2024. We think that diversified portfolios could do 

reasonably well again in 2024, despite a series of challenges. Morgan Stanley’s Global Investment Committee 

thinks that “US Equity and fixed income returns are both likely to be in the mid single digits” for the year. On 

a more global equal-weighted basis, stocks look inexpensive by historical standards (WSJ).  Corporate profits 

for most companies seem to have troughed late last year and be on the upswing. After not offering any yield 

for a decade, bonds are poised to offer not only 4-5 percent nominal returns, but 2.5 percent real returns 

after adjusting for inflation (Fred). As Bernstein notes in the piece linked above, while the average investor is 
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about 2.5 times more aggressively positioned today than they were after the bear market of 2007-2009 (by 

itself that would be an extremely bearish reading to a contrarian) all the risk looks to be concentrated in one 

country and one sector – US Mega Cap technology stocks. That leaves a lot of space to find good returns on 

overlooked high-quality investments.  

3) We think 2 percent inflation is likely no longer a cap on the inflation rate, but a floor – meaning the 

Fed is going to still shoot for 2 percent, but the actual rate will generally be above 2 percent rather than 

below. We think the Fed is going to be motivated to take their foot off the brakes in an election year and that 

doing so is inherently inflationary, all else held equal. That said, the Treasury’s ability to further engage in 

deficit spending will likely be constrained in 2024 -- at least until after November. So, we aren’t predicting 

runaway inflation – just inflation that is higher than the average of the 2000-2020 period. Morgan 

Stanley’s Strategist Michael D. Zesas wrote an excellent 2024 early election guide in which he notes that 

“we expect fiscal expansion could only be supported in the event of an exogenous shock to the economy—

like a recession, which is not in Morgan Stanley & Co. economists’ most recent base case forecast.” That 

sounds right to us. Don’t be surprised if full year inflation in 2024 comes in again between 2.5 and 3 percent 

as it did in 2023. Extending this thinking, we are skeptical the Fed actually provides the full 6 rates cuts 

currently anticipated by markets in 2024 – absent a bona fide recession. That may create some volatility later 

in the year. It also means investors should expect higher-for-longer rates and incorporate that into financial 

planning decisions. 

4)  Investors will spend most of the year worried that election results will dramatically impact markets, but 

in our opinion they shouldn’t. We are not saying that elections don’t matter in the long run.  Our prediction 

is simply that no party emerges with the kind of mandate (or even control) that would be necessary to 

dramatically alter the direction of things so far as markets are concerned. While small changes at the margin 

are almost assured, the endless predictions of economic doom by both sides will ultimately prove incorrect. 

After the election in 2016, Republicans held the House, the Senate, and the Presidency and markets 

immediately rallied on the expectation of tax cuts/stimulus (Congress).  After 2020, Democrats held all three 

and markets immediately rallied on the expectation of increased deficit spending/stimulus (Congress). We 

think 2024 will end up a as a sort of split decision and any immediate market fallout will be more muted. That 

said, the markets will become focused on politics to a more-than-normal degree after the election and early 

in 2025 as the majority of the Tax Cuts and Jobs Act of 2017 is set to sunset on December 31st, 2025. 

We look forward to working with you in 2024. As always, if you have any questions or concerns, please don’t 

hesitate to reach out to any member of the team. We hope you and your family had the happiest of Holiday 

Seasons and enjoyed some well-deserved time off and time together. 
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NOTICE: Morgan Stanley is not acting as a municipal advisor and the opinions or views contained herein are 

not intended to be, and do not constitute, advice within the meaning of Section 975 of the Dodd-Frank Wall 

Street Reform and Consumer Protection Act. If you have received this communication in error, please 

destroy all electronic and paper copies and notify the sender immediately. Mistransmission is not intended to 

waive confidentiality or privilege. Morgan Stanley reserves the right, to the extent permitted under 

applicable law, to monitor electronic communications. This message is subject to terms available at the 

following link:https://www.morganstanley.com/disclaimers. If you cannot access these links, please notify 

us by reply message and we will send the contents to you. By communicating with Morgan Stanley you 

acknowledge that you have read, understand and consent, (where applicable), to the foregoing and the 

Morgan Stanley General Disclaimers. 

 

Please see our Privacy Pledge for details about how Morgan Stanley handles personal information. 

 

If you would like to update your email preferences or unsubscribe from marketing emails from Morgan 

Stanley Wealth Management, you may do so here. Please note, you will still receive service emails from 

Morgan Stanley Wealth Management. 

 

Not all products and services may be available to persons living outside of the United States. 

 

Morgan Stanley Wealth Management 

2000 Westchester Avenue, Purchase, NY 10577-2530 USA 

 

Morgan Stanley Smith Barney LLC. Member SIPC 

 

The views expressed herein are those of the author and do not necessarily reflect the views of Morgan 

Stanley Wealth Management or its affiliates.  All opinions are subject to change without notice.  Neither the 

information provided nor any opinion expressed constitutes a solicitation for the purchase or sale of any 

security.  Past performance is no guarantee of future results. 

 

This material has been prepared for informational purposes only. It does not provide individually tailored 
investment advice. It has been prepared without regard to the individual financial circumstances and 
objectives of persons who receive it. Morgan Stanley Smith Barney LLC (''Morgan Stanley'') recommends 
that investors independently evaluate particular investments and strategies, and encourages investors to 
seek the advice of a Morgan Stanley Financial Advisor. The appropriateness of a particular investment or 
strategy will depend on an investor's individual circumstances and objectives. 

 

Diversification does not guarantee a profit or protect against a loss. 

 

Information contained herein has been obtained from sources considered to be reliable, but we do not 
guarantee their accuracy or completeness. 

 

Please note that by clicking on URL(s) or hyperlink(s) you will leave a Morgan Stanley Smith Barney LLC 
platform and enter website(s) created, operated and maintained by different entities. Morgan Stanley Smith 
Barney LLC is not implying an affiliation, sponsorship, endorsement with/of the third party or that any 
monitoring is being done by Morgan Stanley of any information contained within the linked site(s); nor do 
we guarantee its accuracy or completeness. Morgan Stanley is not responsible for the information contained 
on the third party web site or the use of or inability to use such sites 

https://www.morganstanley.com/disclaimers
https://www.morganstanley.com/privacy-pledge
https://cloud.msmail.morganstanley.com/unsubpagesalesforce?qs=b6654fd4062bf7b51be32b5117d22091a74a0efb3f0f76953d8a2f5f76c44cb7


 

Indices are unmanaged. An investor cannot invest directly in an index. For index, indicator and survey 
definitions referenced in this report please visit the following: https://www.morganstanley.com/wealth-
investmentsolutions/wmir-definitions 

 

International investing may not be appropriate for every investor and is subject to additional risks,including 

currency fluctuations, political factors, withholding, lack of liquidity, the absence of adequate financial 
information, and exchange control restrictions impacting foreign issuers. These risks may be magnified in 
emerging markets. 

 

The investments listed may not be appropriate for all investors. Morgan Stanley Smith Barney LLC 
recommends that investors independently evaluate particular investments, and encourages investors to seek 
the advice of a financial advisor. The appropriateness of a particular investment will depend upon an 
investor's individual circumstances and objectives. 

 

CRC 6240750 01/2024 

 

 

 


