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A Chinese proverb states, “To say you don’t know is the beginning of knowing.” However, in a chaotic, 
fast moving, random world, people crave certainty. They want answers. And there is a strong 
temptation to provide answers – with certainty – even when said answer carries the weight of uncertain 
probabilities. This delusional certainty – often a joint delusion amongst all involved parties – can lead to 
consequential decision errors. When faced with questions involving a high degree of variables, many of 
them random, it’s often better to start with, “I don’t know.” 
 
“I don’t know” is not a cop-out. It’s an acknowledgment that there are too many factors at play to make 
decisions with certainty. Howard Marks of Oaktree, an investment firm, is fond of saying, “We 
encourage our teams to make forecasts about the economy, interest rates, etc…but it’s not OK to bet on 
those forecasts.” A forecast helps gauge probabilities and forces the forecaster to think through variable 
paths. But there is a wide gulf between a forecast and “knowing” – “I place a 65% probability on short 
term interest rates being 4% by year-end,” is a lot different than, “short term interest rates will be at 4% 
by year-end.” 
 
A non-investment related example, a few years back I suffered a bout of what turned out to be sciatic 
nerve pain, stemming from a long-term spinal disc problem (itself stemming from, most likely, years of 
abuse from skiing). I went to see a doctor, and his original diagnosis was a strained piriformis muscle. 
Not, “It might be you piriformis muscle, but we’ll do an CT scan to further investigate.” No, it was, “It’s 
your piriformis muscle.” And off to PT I went, with a prescription for muscle relaxers in hand. But it 
wasn’t the piriformis muscle. And after two weeks of PT, and a worsening condition, I went back to the 
doctor, who then sent me to an orthopedist. Being a joint doctor, his diagnosis was, “Hip problem.” 
Now, I tend to have confidence in professional opinions, so deferred to the doctor, and took a series of 
steroid injections and more PT. But a few more weeks later, still in pain, I was back in the orthopedist’s 
office. Finally, a CT scan was ordered. It wasn’t my piriformis muscle. I didn’t have a hip problem. What I 
had was a herniated disc, pressuring my spine, and sending pain down my leg. The “certainty” of the 
doctors cost me roughly a month of delayed treatment for the real problem. “I don’t know,” followed by 
investigative testing, would in hindsight have been the proper path. 
 
The client / advisor relationship often faces the challenge of questions appropriately met by “I don’t 
know.” When you’re paying an advisor meaningful dollars, answers with certainty, on the surface, are a 
reasonable expectation. The problem – the economy and markets are not fixed systems with consistent 
cause and effect and a static range of probabilistic outcomes (like, for example, the range of outcomes 
in the card game, blackjack). Rather, the economy and markets are complex, random, dynamic systems, 
inputting trillions of variables that continuously shift. Further, the actions of participants changes the 
dynamics in real time, an effect George Soros, noted investor, refers to as reflexivity. We’ve used this 
analogy before, it’s as if you’re rock climbing, and where you decide to place your feet on the rock wall 
then changes the shape of the wall itself. 



 

 

 

 
To navigate in this dynamic environment, probabilistic thinking has to be employed. What (hopefully) 
improves over time, as a professional, is your odds making skills. But probabilistic thinking contains a 
degree of “I don’t know,” and sometimes that degree is high. If you ask, “Is a US treasury bond a solid 
credit,” we can answer yes, with an extremely high conviction in the probability we’re right. Call it 
“almost” certain. But if you ask, “What do you think the market will do this year,” we will answer, “I 
don’t know,” because that is the right answer. It’s not giving you a false sense of security, nor is it 
incentivizing us to bet your capital on mis-calibrated odds. Instead, it forces a reckoning of the inherent 
uncertainty any investor faces, and consequently incentivizes us to look for ways to reduce risk, 
primarily through diversification of holdings. 
 
Watch financial news sometime (surprising, because we never encourage this), and pay attention to the 
guests. A few are humble, and plainly acknowledge the uncertainty they face. But many speak with 
“authority” - the “market will do x this year”; “interest rates will finish the year at y.”  Then ask, “How do 
they know this?” And “Do they acknowledge their limitations?”  Most do not, and as they appear 
authoritative, listeners can mistake these guesses for certainty. 
 
As a team, we bring a lot of skills to bear. Sadly, fortune telling is not one of them. We believe our odds 
making skills are highly calibrated, but we don’t mistake that for certainty. And we’re not afraid to say, “I 
don’t know.”  After all, it’s the beginning of knowing. 
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Source: Forbes.com (Awarded 2019-2020 & 2022). Data compiled by SHOOK Research LLC based 12-month time period concluding in June of 
year prior to the issuance of the award. 
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